
AGENDA
CUMBERLAND COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

JUDGE E. MAURICE BRASWELL
CUMBERLAND COUNTY COURTHOUSE - ROOM 118

NOVEMBER 4, 2019
9:00 AM

INVOCATION - Commissioner Marshall Faircloth, Vice Chairman

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE -

Recognition of Retired Cumberland County Employee
Bobbie Redding - Cumberland County Department of Social Services

1. APPROVAL OF AGENDA

2. PRESENTATIONS

A. Presentation on the PWC Community Solar Customer Offering by Mr. Mark Brown,
Senior Customer Programs Officer

B. Presentation of the 2018-2019 Fair Housing Board Highlights by Mr. Otis Cuffee

C. Presentation of the 2018-2019 Human Relations Commission Highlights by Mr. Eric
Olsen, Human Relations Commission Vice Chair

D. Presentation on the Cumberland County Solid Waste Department EWaste Recycling &
Shred Event by Amanda Bader, Solid Waste Director

3. CONSENT AGENDA

A. Approval of Minutes of the October 17, 2019 Special Meeting for the Capital Planning
Model and the October 21, 2019 Regular Board Meeting

B. Approval of the 2020 Board of Commissioners' Regular Meeting Dates

C. Approval of Bid Award for Aerial Mosquito Spray Standby Contract
 

D. Approval of Formal Bid Award for Sheriff's Office Vehicle Accessories

E. Approval of Acceptance of Workers Compensation Settlement

F. Approval to Pay Prior Year Invoices

G. Approval of Recycle Right NC Proclamation

H. Approval of Budget Ordinance Amendments for the November 4, 2019 Board of
Commissioners' Agenda

4. ITEMS OF BUSINESS **There are no Items of Business for this Meeting**

5. NOMINATIONS

A. Senior Citizens Advisory Commission (1 Vacancy)



6. APPOINTMENTS

A. Cumberland County Juvenile Crime Prevention Council (2 Vacancies)

ADJOURN

WATCH THE MEETING LIVE
 
THIS MEETING WILL BE STREAMED LIVE THROUGH THE COUNTY'S
WEBSITE, CO.CUMBERLAND.NC.US. LOOK FOR THE LINK AT THE TOP OF
THE HOMEPAGE.
 
THE MEETING WILL ALSO BE BROADCAST LIVE ON
FAYETTEVILLE/CUMBERLAND EDUCATIONAL TV (FCETV),  SPECTRUM
CHANNEL 5.

IT WILL BE REBROADCAST ON WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 6, AT 7:00 PM
AND FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 8, AT 10:30 AM.

REGULAR BOARD MEETINGS:

November 18, 2019 (Monday) - 6:45 PM
December 2, 2019 (Monday) - 9:00 AM
December 16, 2019 (Monday) - 6:45 PM

THE MEETING VIDEO WILL BE AVAILABLE
ATYOUTUBE.COM/CUMBERLANDCOUNTYNC



OFFICE OF THE COUNTY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMY H. CANNON, COUNTY MANAGER

DATE: 10/29/2019

SUBJECT: PRESENTATION ON THE PWC COMMUNITY SOLAR CUSTOMER
OFFERING BY MR. MARK BROWN, SENIOR CUSTOMER PROGRAMS
OFFICER

BACKGROUND

Mr. Mark Brown, Senior Customer Programs Officer will be making a presentation on PWC's Community
Solar Customer Offering at the November 4, 2019 Board of Commissioners' meeting.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

For information purposes only.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
PWC Community Solar Customer Offering Presentation Backup Material



COMMUNITY SOLAR CUSTOMER OFFERING

MARK BROWN –SENIOR CUSTOMER PROGRAMS OFFICER



 Project Summary
 Battery Component Economics
 Solar Array Economics
 Community Solar Customer Offering
 Community Solar Rate Request

2

Items to Cover



 What the Community Solar Project is not….
• Not designed to mirror or replace rooftop solar installations/economics

• Maximum subscription is 5 panels which is about 1.5kW total  
average rooftop system is around 5kW

• Not an ownership model
• Not subsidized by non-participating PWC customers electric rates
• Not a revenue source for PWC

 What the Community Solar Project is…
• A economical way for PWC customers to get involved with solar energy

• Including those with rental properties or who are with the military 
• A subscription model - PWC retains ownership
• Solar array modeled to be 100% breakeven at end of life

• All costs and benefits separated and tracked

3

Project Summary



 Battery connected to solar array for charging
 Battery to be used to reduce coincident peak demand 

charge from Duke
• Will be used in conjunction with our other demand response programs 

such as voltage reduction, where we have a 90% success rate hitting 
the coincident peak 

 Over the 15 year projected life the battery designed to 
average 500kW of output

 Battery installed cost $931,000
 Average O&M costs of Battery $5,370/yr.
 Average reduction in Power Supply costs $119,576/yr.
 Battery simple payback roughly 8 years
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Battery Economics



 Following model of other Municipalities, Community Solar 
designed to be 100% breakeven at end of 25 year life
• Including O&M, planned inverter replacement and decommissioning

 Annual O&M costs average $19,050/yr
 Contribution to reserve fund for decommissioning & 

inverter replacement $26,000/yr
 Power Supply cost reduction average $98,000/yr based on 

NC State modeling


 * Subject to NCUC REPS review
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Community Solar Economics

Installed Cost $1,548,500
REPS Funding* $   570,400
Balance $   978,100



 Customer offer based on solar array being 100% 
breakeven after 25 years
• Based upon actual results customer credit can be modified periodically 

to maintain breakeven economics over long term
• Will use reserve fund to balance minor yearly fluctuations

 Offer based upon individual solar panel subscriptions 
with a maximum of 5 panels per customer
• Total of 3,384 panels available to subscribe

 Panels initially “reserved” based on customer 
classifications   

 4% interest rate applied to $978,100 balance of first cost 
to reimburse PWC customers for use of upfront capital
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Community Solar Customer Offer



 Offer Summary
• $20 Enrollment Fee on 1st panel, each additional panel $10
• Monthly Fee to recover balance of installed 1st cost - $1.53/panel
• Initial monthly customer credit net of O&M and Reserve - $2.51/panel
• Initial monthly bill credit $2.51 - $1.53 = $0.98/panel
• PWC to retain solar RECS for REPS compliance 

7

Community Solar Customer Offer

Panels Enrollment 
Fee

Net Monthly 
Credit

Annual 
Credit

Payback on 
Enrollment Fee

1 $20 $   0.98 $   11.80 20 months
2 $30 $   1.97 $   23.61 15 months 
3 $40 $   2.95 $   35.41 14 months 
4 $50 $   3.93 $   47.21 13 months 
5 $60 $   4.92 $   59.02 12 months 



COMMUNITY SOLAR CUSTOMER OFFERING

MARK BROWN – SENIOR CUSTOMER PROGRAM OFFICER



OFFICE OF THE COUNTY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMY H. CANNON, COUNTY MANAGER

DATE: 10/28/2019

SUBJECT: PRESENTATION OF THE 2018-2019 FAIR HOUSING BOARD HIGHLIGHTS
BY MR. OTIS CUFFEE

BACKGROUND

Mr. Otis Cuffee, a member of the Fair Housing Board, will be making a presentation on the 2018-2019 Fair
Housing Board Highlights at the November 4, 2019 Board of Commissioners' meeting.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

For information purposes only.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
2018-2019 Fair Housing Board Highlights Presentation Backup Material



2018-2019 
HIGHLIGHTS



The members of the Fayetteville Fair Housing Board are 
honored to have served in support of fair housing education 
and enforcement programs for the residents of Cumberland 
County.  Through its collaboration with the Fayetteville-
Cumberland Human Relations Department, the Board’s efforts 
have supported the “Analysis of Impediments to Fair Housing” 
recommendations referenced in the 2015-2020 City/County 
Consolidated Plan.  The Board is pleased to provide a summary 
of activities and programs that highlight our efforts to address 
allegations of housing discrimination by our residents and to 
sponsor events that create greater awareness of the local 
Ordinance and associated state and federal laws that protect 
against housing discrimination. 

The Board thanks County Government for its support in 
promoting community engagement events. Additional thanks 
are extended to the Human Relations Department for its 
excellent staff support in the accomplishments of the Board’s 
programs and objectives.  

A sincere “Thank You” to the Cumberland County  
Commissioners for receiving this presentation and to County 
Government for its support and collaboration involving fair 
housing for all.  

Otis Cuffee
Member, Fair Housing Board



PUBLIC SERVICE 
ANNOUNCEMENTS

FAIR HOUSING BOARD 
MEMBERS 

AND 
HUMAN RELATIONS 

STAFF UTILIZE MASS 
MEDIA TO INCREASE 

AWARENESS AND 
SUPPORT



PROVIDING 
COUNTY 

RESIDENTS 
INFORMATION ON 

PROGRAMS & 
SERVICES

2018 & 2019 
INTERNATIONAL 
FOLK FESTIVAL

MEMBERS OF THE FAIR 
HOUSING BOARD, 
FAYETTEVILLE-

CUMBERLAND HUMAN 
RELATIONS COMMISSION 

AND STAFF MEMBERS 
PROVIDED INFORMATION 

TO OVER 600 
INDIVIDUALS



BILINGUAL 
TRAINING FOR

COUNTY ESL YOUTH 
Collaboration with

Cumberland County 
Library System

S
P
A
N
I
S
H



BILINGUAL 
TRAINING FOR
COUNTY ESL 
RESIDENTS

F
R
E
N
C
H



FAIR HOUSING 
TRAINING IN 

AMERICAN SIGN 
LANGUAGE FOR 
RESIDENTS WHO 

ARE HEARING 
IMPAIRED



VETERANS 
LISTENING SESSION

ON HOUSING 
DISCRIMINATION 

at County 
Department of Social 

Services
Collaboration with the 

N.C. Fair Housing Project,  
Fayetteville Fair Housing 
Board, Legal Aid of N.C., 

N.C. Housing Coalition, and 
Fayetteville-Cumberland 

Human Relations 
Department

Supported by 
Cumberland County 
Veterans Services



FAIR HOUSING 
TRAINING 

for the
BEAUTY, HAIR 

CARE AND 
COSMETOLOGY 

COMMUNITY



2018 HOUSING 
AND RESOURCE 

COMMUNITY FAIR 

Distributed information 
to  facilitate awareness of 

housing resources and 
assistance available to the 

public



2019 FAIR 
HOUSING 

TRAINING FOR 
HOUSING 

PROVIDERS



LOCAL 
COLLABORATION 
ON FAIR HOUSING 

TRAINING 
with the 

D.C. NATIONAL 
COMMUNITY 

REINVESTMENT 
COALITION (NCRC)



ENHANCING 
AWARENESS OF 
FAIR HOUSING 

RIGHTS 
FOR THE
COUNTY’S 

LATINO RESIDENTS 
Through 

Media Interviews 
on 

Spanish-Language 
Television Network 

UNIVISION 40



PROVIDING 
INFORMATION TO 

COUNTY RESIDENTS 
ON PROGRAMS & 
SERVICES AT THE 

2018 & 2019 
DOGWOOD 
FESTIVALS



FAIR HOUSING TRAINING FOR ESL PARENTS
Collaboration with the Cumberland County Schools’ 

English as a Second Language Department



# of Fair Housing Complaints NC
State, County, City

YEAR STATE COUNTY CITY TOTALS

2018 54 1 11 66

2019* 26 8 10 44

TOTALS 80 9 21 110

* 2019 cases filed to date.



OFFICE OF THE COUNTY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMY H. CANNON, COUNTY MANAGER

DATE: 10/28/2019

SUBJECT: PRESENTATION OF THE 2018-2019 HUMAN RELATIONS COMMISSION
HIGHLIGHTS BY MR. ERIC OLSEN, HUMAN RELATIONS COMMISSION
VICE CHAIR

BACKGROUND

Mr. Eric Olsen, Vice Chair of the Human Relations Commission will be making a presentation on the 2018-
2019 Human Relations Commission Highlights at the November 4, 2019 Board of Commissioners' meeting.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

For information purposes only.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
2018-2019 Human Relations Commission Highlights Presentation Backup Material



2018-2019 
HUMAN RELATIONS 

COMMISSION HIGHLIGHTS



This brief overview of the activities of the Fayetteville-
Cumberland Human Relations Commission is  provided for 
your information.  The efforts of the Commissioners and 
Staff are reflective of our commitment and dedication in 
serving our residents. It has been my honor to be 
associated with this group of “servant-leaders” who have 
focused solely on quality-of-life issues for this community.  

With ongoing, trustworthy assistance and collaboration  
from the Human Relations Department, the Commission 
has fostered outreach and awareness of its programs and 
services.  Their active involvement facilitated the 
successful accomplishment of our FY 2018-19 objectives.

Thanks to the leadership of the City of Fayetteville 
and Cumberland County Government for your ongoing 
support of our mission and existence.  Because of you, we 
are able to continue our work as defined by the Ordinance 
involving equity, inclusion and fair treatment for all.

Sincerely,
Eric Olson, Commission Vice-Chair



2019 COMMISSIONERS2019 COMMISSIONERS
AND STAFF



COMMISSIONERS

Eric Olson, Vice Chair, Interim Chair

Dr. Mark Kendrick, Secretary

Kevin Brooks Rosa Garris-Turner Georgeanna Pinckney

Joshua James Sergeant Major Jeffrey Wire Lieutenant Colonel Gregory Foxx

Ayax Rangel Dawn M. Rheaume Maria del Pilar Salvat

Franco K. Webb Larry Bellamy Lieutenant Colonel Julia Kobiska

Semone R. Pemberton William J Milton II Milette Harris 



OTHER COMMISSIONERS WHO SERVED DURING THIS PERIOD

Sheila Cuffee, Chair 
Vicki Teachey-Dukes, Chair, Vice Chair

Maybelyn Rodriguez Laureano, Vice Chair, Secretary
Donna Pelham, Vice-Chair

Ngozi Kamalu, Hate Crimes Committee Chair
Antoinette Morris, Chair, Nominating Committee & Strategic Planning Committee 

Robert McRae, Dr. MLK Jr Scholarship Committee Chair; Historian
Linda Amos, MLK Jr. Scholarship Committee Chair
Melba Conley, Special Projects Committee Chair

Wesley Fountain, By-Laws Committee Chair
Ingrid Marthy

Zarah Coll
Sarah Hackett



2018-19 HIGHLIGHTS



2018 2018 COMMISSION 2018 2018 COMMISSION COMMISSION 
STRATEGIC 

COMMISSION COMMISSION 
STRATEGIC STRATEGIC PLANNING STRATEGIC STRATEGIC PLANNING PLANNING 

RETREAT



2018 2018 RAPID RESPONSE 2018 2018 RAPID RESPONSE RAPID RESPONSE 
PLANNING SESSION ON PLANNING SESSION ON 
HATE/BIAS INCIDENTS HATE/BIAS INCIDENTS 
WITH PUBLIC SAFETY WITH PUBLIC SAFETY 

LEADERS



THE COMMISSION’S 2018 DR. MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. THE COMMISSION’S 2018 DR. MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. 
SCHOLARSHIP RECIPIENTS



THE COMMISSION’S THE COMMISSION’S 2019 2019 DR. MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. THE COMMISSION’S THE COMMISSION’S 2019 2019 2019 DR. MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. DR. MARTIN LUTHER KING JR. 
SCHOLARSHIP RECIPIENTS



BILINGUAL PUBLIC SAFETY ANNOUNCEMENTS BILINGUAL PUBLIC SAFETY ANNOUNCEMENTS 
DURING NATURAL DISASTERS



SUPPORT OF EMERGENCY OPERATIONS CENTER SUPPORT OF EMERGENCY OPERATIONS CENTER 
DURING PUBLIC SAFETY EMERGENCIES



PROVIDING PROGRAMS/SERVICES PROVIDING PROGRAMS/SERVICES 
INFORMATION 

PROVIDING PROGRAMS/SERVICES PROVIDING PROGRAMS/SERVICES 
INFORMATION INFORMATION TO THE PUBLIC

• Commissioners and Staff shared services 
and program information at the following 
events:

• 2017 WIDU Anniversary  
• 2017 and 2018 International Folk 

Festival
• 2017 and 2018 PRIDE Festivals
• 2018 Dogwood Festival  



2018/2019 RECOGNITION OF SUPPORT FOR 2018/2019 RECOGNITION OF SUPPORT FOR 
SPECIAL MILITARY ETHNIC OBSERVANCES  SPECIAL MILITARY ETHNIC OBSERVANCES  

FORT BRAGG



2019 ANNUAL AWARDS AND RECOGNITION RECEPTION



2019 2019 ANNUAL AWARDS AND RECOGNITION RECEPTION

FCHRC Lifetime Achievement 
Award Recipient

Retired Fayetteville Fire Chief 
Benjamin Major

• For more than 30 years promoted 
human relations and served as a 
role model for youth

• Initiated diversity and inclusion 
efforts and progress in public safety 
and the community



2019 2019 ANNUAL AWARDS AND RECOGNITION RECEPTION

FCHRC Lifetime Achievement 
Award Recipient

Retired Fayetteville Fire Chief 
Benjamin Major

• For more than 30 years promoted 
human relations and served as a 
role model for youth

• Initiated diversity and inclusion 
efforts and progress in public safety 
and the community



COMMISSIONERS PROVIDING TRAINING AT 2019 N.C. HR COMMISSIONERS PROVIDING TRAINING AT 2019 N.C. HR 
COMMISSIONS AND COUNCILS MEETING IN FAYETTEVILLE



2019 QUARTERLY FILM SCREENINGS 2019 QUARTERLY FILM SCREENINGS 
AND COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT EVENTS



““THE HATE 
U 

THE HATE THE HATE 
U GIVE” SESSIONS



HUMAN RELATIONS COMMISSIONERSHUMAN RELATIONS COMMISSIONERS
FACILITATING GROUP SESSIONS



SHERIFF’S OFFICE ENGAGEMENT  SHERIFF’S OFFICE ENGAGEMENT  
DURING “THE HATE U GIVE” SESSIONS



SHERIFF’S OFFICE ENGAGEMENT  SHERIFF’S OFFICE ENGAGEMENT  
DURING “THE HATE U GIVE” SESSIONS



COMMISSION MEETING IN THE COMMISSION MEETING IN THE TOWN OF SPRING LAKE



COMMISSION MEETING IN COMMISSION MEETING IN THE TOWN OF THE TOWN OF HOPE MILLS



ENGAGEMENT WITH LINDEN & GODWIN ELECTED OFFICIALSENGAGEMENT WITH LINDEN & GODWIN ELECTED OFFICIALS
AT THE LINDEN SPLASH PAD GRAND OPENING



ENGAGEMENT ENGAGEMENT WITH ENGAGEMENT 
CUMBERLAND 

WITH WITH ENGAGEMENT ENGAGEMENT 
CUMBERLAND CUMBERLAND COUNTY CUMBERLAND CUMBERLAND COUNTY COUNTY 

MANAGEMENT



ENGAGEMENT WITH THE DISTRICT ATTORNEY’S OFFICE



PRESENTATION OF COMMISSION ACTIVITIES TO  PRESENTATION OF COMMISSION ACTIVITIES TO  
GREATER FAYETTEVILLE UNITED



COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT WITH OUR MILITARY  COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT WITH OUR MILITARY  
FORT 

COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT WITH OUR MILITARY  COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT WITH OUR MILITARY  
FORT FORT BRAGG AND POPE ARMY AIRFIELD



THE THE INININ-IN-KIND VALUE OF COMMISSION VOLUNTEER TIME

As of June, 30, 2019 Human Relations Commissioners have 

contributed 449.5 hours of volunteer service resulting in a 

savings in terms of in-kind dollars of $10,334.00 in Fiscal 
Year 2018-19.



OFFICE OF THE COUNTY MANAGER

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: MELISSA CARDINALI, ASSISTANT COUNTY MANAGER

DATE: 10/30/2019

SUBJECT: PRESENTATION ON THE CUMBERLAND COUNTY SOLID WASTE
DEPARTMENT EWASTE RECYCLING & SHRED EVENT BY AMANDA
BADER, SOLID WASTE DIRECTOR

BACKGROUND

Ms. Amanda Bader, Cumberland County Solid Waste Director, will be making a short presentation on the
Cumberland County Solid Waste Department EWaste Recycling & Shred Event which is scheduled for
Saturday, November 16, 2019.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

For information purposes only.



CLERK TO THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: CANDICE H. WHITE, CLERK TO THE BOARD

DATE: 11/4/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF THE 2020 BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS' REGULAR
MEETING DATES

BACKGROUND

Each year the Board of Commissioners considers adoption of its regular meeting dates for the upcoming calendar
year and each year there are exceptions that have to be considered.  The exceptions for calendar year 2020 include
the following:
 

The second meeting in January has been moved to Tuesday, January 21 because the preceding Monday,
January 20, will be observed as Martin Luther King, Jr. Day.
 
The first meeting in March has been cancelled because the NACo Legislative Goals Conference will be
held Saturday through Wednesday, February 29 - March 4, in Washington, DC.
 
The first meeting in September has been moved to Tuesday, September 8 because the preceding Monday,
September 7, will be observed as Labor Day. 

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Adopt the 2020 Board of Commissioners’ regular meeting dates as proposed or amended. 

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Board of Commissioners' 2020 Regular Meeting Dates Backup Material



 
 

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  
2020 REGULAR MEETING DATES 

 
 
 

 
January 6, 2020, 9:00AM  
January 21, 2020, 6:45PM (Tuesday) 
 
February 3, 2020, 9:00AM 
February 17, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
NO MEETING (NACo Legislative Goals Conference February 29-March 4) 
March 16, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
April 6, 2020, 9:00AM  
April 20, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
May 4, 2020, 9:00AM 
May 18, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
June 1, 2020, 9:00AM 
June 15, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
July – NO MEETINGS 
 
August 3, 2020, 9:00AM 
August 17, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
September 8, 2020, 9:00AM (Tuesday) 
September 21, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
October 5, 2020, 9:00AM 
October 19, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
November 2, 2020, 9:00AM 
November 16, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
December 7, 2020, 9:00AM 
December 21, 2020, 6:45PM 
 
All meetings are on held on Monday, except as noted above, in Room 118 of the Judge E. 
Maurice Braswell Cumberland County Courthouse located at 117 Dick Street in 
Fayetteville, N.C. 



FINANCE OFFICE

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMANDA BULLARD, PURCHASING MANAGER

DATE: 10/23/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF BID AWARD FOR AERIAL MOSQUITO SPRAY STANDBY
CONTRACT

BACKGROUND

In the event of a natural disaster, aerial mosquito control services may be required to control an increase in the
mosquito population. Standby contracts for these services are imperative to have in place as they allow the
County to begin serving the community immediately following an event without waiting for a bid process to be
completed, as mandated by Federal Uniform Guidance Procurement Policy for Local Governments ("Uniform
Guidelines"). The contract term shall be for an initial period of one year with the option to renew for two
additional one-year terms.

Bids were solicited, received, and reviewed by Health Department staff for this service. Allen Aviation, Inc.
offered the lowest overall cost per acre. 

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Finance and Purchasing staff recommend approval to award IFB (Invitation for Bids) Number 19-21-CTY to
Allen Aviation, Inc., based on the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder standard of award.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Cost Comparison Backup Material



Vendor Chemical Name
Total Application Rate 

Per Acre (In Ounces)

Chemical Cost 

Per Acre

Vendor Applicate 

Fee Per Acre
Cost Per Acre Other Fees

Total Estimated 

Cost (410,000 

Acre x Cost Per 

Acre + Other 

Fees)

Trumpet: 0.80 $0.97 $0.72 $1.69

$12,500 

Mobilization Fee 

When Activated

$705,400.00

Dibrom (Naled): 0.60 $0.94 $0.66 $1.60

$12,500 

Mobilization Fee 

When Activated

$668,500.00

Trumpet: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dibrom (Naled): 0.66 $1.23 $0.80 $2.03

$250 Per Trap 

(Estimated 5-10 

Traps Required)

$834,800.00

Trumpet: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dibrom (Naled): 0.66 $1.22 $0.88 $2.10 NA $861,000.00

*Even if other two vendors bid on Trumpet  chemical, Allen Aviation is still the lowest. 

19-21-CTY

Bid Tabulation

Estimated County Spray Area in Acre: 410,000

Allen Aviation, Inc. 

Vector Disease Control 

International

Clarke Environmental 

Mosquito Management, 

Inc.



FINANCE OFFICE

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMANDA BULLARD, PURCHASING MANAGER

DATE: 10/23/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF FORMAL BID AWARD FOR SHERIFF'S OFFICE VEHICLE
ACCESSORIES

BACKGROUND

Funds in the amount $140,000 were approved and appropriated in the Sheriff's Office fiscal year 2020 budget
for the purchase of accessories for thirteen new vehicles.
 
Formal bids were solicited, received and reviewed by the respective department. Only one response was
received. Dana Safety Supply submitted a bid in the amount of $129,029.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Finance and Purchasing staff recommend awarding bid number 12-11-SO to Dana Safety Supply, based on
the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder standard of award.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Supporting Documents Backup Material











RISK MANAGEMENT

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: VICKI EVANS, FINANCE DIRECTOR

DATE: 10/28/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF ACCEPTANCE OF WORKERS COMPENSATION
SETTLEMENT

BACKGROUND

During a closed session on September 3, 2019, the Board of Commissioners approved moving forward with a
workers compensation settlement.  Per NCGS § 143-318.11, the terms of that settlement shall be reported to
the public body and entered into its minutes as soon as possible within a reasonable time after the settlement is
concluded.  The Order Approving Compromise Settlement Agreement is attached.
 
Please note:  Commissioner Adams recused himself from the closed session on September 3, 2019 specific to
this discussion.
 

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Accept the report of Order Approving Compromise Settlement Agreement, filed on October 9, 2019 by the
North Carolina Industrial Commission.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Order Approving Compromise Settlement Agreement Backup Material





FINANCE OFFICE

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: VICKI EVANS, FINANCE DIRECTOR

DATE: 10/25/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL TO PAY PRIOR YEAR INVOICES

BACKGROUND

There is a period of time after June 30th of fiscal year-end in which transactions of the prior fiscal year will
continue to be processed (typically until the third week in August).  After that cutoff date has passed, a
department may still receive a vendor invoice that is payable for services that were rendered, or goods were
received in the prior fiscal year.  When that occurs, approval by the Board of Commissioners is required for
payment.  The following departmental invoices meet that criteria:
 
Solid Waste Management
Vendor:  Strategic Materials
Invoice Date:  6/18/2019
Total Amount:  $400.18
 
Solid Waste Management
Vendor:  City Electric Supply
Invoice Date:  2/13/2019
Total Amount:  $6.53
 
Staff have verified these invoices have not been paid.  There are sufficient funds within the fiscal year 2020
departmental budget to cover these expenses.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Management is requesting approval to pay prior year invoices for Solid Waste totaling $406.71.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Prior year payment request memos for 11-4-19 Backup Material









ASSISTANT COUNTY MANAGER GENERAL GOVERNMENT AND STEWARDSHIP

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: AMANDA L. BADER, PE

DATE: 10/30/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF RECYCLE RIGHT NC PROCLAMATION

BACKGROUND

The recycling landscape is changing from a dependence on foreign markets to supplying our domes�c
markets.  Material recovery facili�es (MRFs), which sort out different categories of recyclables for sale and
distribu�on to different markets, are now focusing on improving material quality and selling recyclables in
America. The “Recycle Right NC” campaign is an ini�a�ve by the NC Department of Environmental Quality
with a focus on reducing contamina�on in recycling. 
The desired outcome is be+er messaging to prevent contamina�on of recyclables. Recycling s�mulates our
local economy, creates jobs, saves energy and water, reduces greenhouse gas emissions, preserves natural
resources and conserves landfill space.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

County Management recommends approval of the proclama�on for “Recycle Right NC” Month November
2019.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Local Recycle Right NC Proclamation Proclamation



COUNTY OF CUMBERLAND                          NORTH CAROLINA 

Proclamation 
 

Cumberland County “Recycle Right NC” 
 

 
WHEREAS, North Carolina communities have established excellent recycling programs, and with the 

presence of strong established markets in the state, are able to redirect recycled materials back into the economy 
and create new products; and 
 

WHEREAS, recycling stimulates local economies, creates jobs, saves energy and water, reduces 
greenhouse gas emissions, preserves natural resources and conserves landfill space; and 
 

WHEREAS, the North Carolina recycling industry supports more than 16,000 jobs and relies on the 
success of community recycling programs; and 
 

WHEREAS, Cumberland County Solid Waste recycled 9,000 tons of material last fiscal year; and 
 

WHEREAS, the increasing amounts of non-recyclable items, or contaminants, being placed in recycling 
bins compromises the quality of truly recyclable materials and creates safety hazards for employees at the 
materials recovery facility where recyclables are sorted; and  
 

WHEREAS, recycling costs can be lowered by reducing the amount of contaminants in the mix; and 
 

WHEREAS, educating residents about which items go into the recycling container is the most effective 
way to recover the most recyclable material and avoid contamination; and 
 

WHEREAS, to focus the state’s attention on the importance of reducing contamination in recycling, the 
N.C. Department of Environmental Quality has created the “Recycle Right NC” campaign to educate the public 
on which items should and should not be placed in the recycling cart; and  
 

WHEREAS, participating in the “Recycle Right NC” campaign is an effective way to raise awareness 
about the need to recycle only the items accepted by local recycling programs; and 
 

WHEREAS, Cumberland County pledges to participate in the “Recycle Right NC” statewide campaign 
as an opportunity to contribute to a larger movement to improve recycling and lead the nation in recycling 
education through harmonized messaging; 
 

Now, Therefore, the Cumberland County Board of Commissioners do hereby pledge a proclamation of 
support and participation in the “Recycle Right NC” campaign on this 4th day of November 2019. 
 
 

___________________________________________ 
            Jeannette Council, Chairman 
           Cumberland County Board of Commissioners 
 



BUDGET DIVISION

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: MELISSA CARDINALI, ASSISTANT COUNTY MANAGER

DATE: 10/29/2019

SUBJECT: APPROVAL OF BUDGET ORDINANCE AMENDMENTS FOR THE
NOVEMBER 4, 2019 BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS' AGENDA

BACKGROUND

General Fund 101 

1) Sheriff’s Office Grants- Budget Ordinance Amendment B200954 to reconcile actual grant awards
to the FY20 budget in the amount of $150,474 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200954 to reconcile actual grant funds
awarded to the amounts budgeted in FY20. The National Incident Based Reporting System (NBIR) and the
BYRNE grants are multi-year grants. When these grants were budgeted during the FY20 budget process,
amounts were estimates. 

Please note this amendment requires no additional county funds. 

2) Emergency Services Grants- Budget Ordinance Amendment B200785 to recognize a grant award
in the amount of $10,000 from the North Carolina Department of Public Safety 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200785 to recognize a grant award in the
amount of $10,000 from the North Carolina Department of Public Safety Hazardous Materials Emergency
Preparedness Grant Program (HMEP). Funding will be used to conduct a full-scale hazardous materials spill
exercise. Cumberland County Emergency Services along with the Local Emergency Planning Committee will
work in conjunction with local industries to perform the exercise. 

Please note this amendment requires no additional county funds. 

3) Animal Control- Budget Ordinance Amendment B200846 to recognize a grant in the amount of



$60,000 to help increase pet adoptions 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200846 to recognize grant funds in the
amount of $60,000 from the Petco Foundation. This grant will be used to fund programs designed to increase
pet adoptions and reduce animal intakes. 

Please note this amendment requires no additional county funds. 

Juvenile Crime Prevention Fund 245 

4) Juvenile Crime Prevention Programs - Budget Ordinance Amendment B201067 to reflect
programs amounts as approved by the North Carolina Department of Public Safety, Division of
Juvenile Justice in the FY20 budget 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B201067 to amend the following programs
in the amount of $190,408 to reflect actual funding amounts from the North Carolina Department of Public
Safety, Division of Juvenile Justice. The programs are: Teen Court - $19,334, Fayetteville-Cumberland Juvenile
Restitution – ($1,576), Find-A-Friend Career Readiness Program - $87,150 and the Boys and Girls Club
$85,500. 

Please note this amendment requires no additional county funds. 

REGARDING THE FOLLOWING ITEMS 5 – 8 PLEASE NOTE: 

Each fiscal year County departments may have projects that are not complete by the fiscal year end (6/30/19)
or items ordered that have not been received by fiscal year end. These projects or items were approved in the
Fiscal Year 2019 budget; however, the money was not spent by June 30, 2019. 

The following amendments seek to bring those funds forward from FY 2019 into the current fiscal year,
allowing departments to complete and pay for these items. These revisions are not using ‘new’ funds but are
recognizing the use of FY19 funds in FY20. 

General Fund 101 

5) Planning- Budget Ordinance Amendment B200378 to re-appropriate FY19 grant funds in the
amount of $25,852 for the North Carolina Regional Bike Plan 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200378 to re-appropriate FY19 funds in
the amount of $25,852 for the North Carolina Regional Bike Plan. The Bike Plan was originally approved
during the FY18 Adopted Budget in the amount of $225,000. This amount represents the remaining balance of
the grant. 

Community Development Fund 265 

6) Housing Activities and Public Facilities - Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-
appropriate FY19 funds in the amount of $549,614 for Community Development Housing Activities
and $350,000 for Community Development Public Facilities 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-appropriate FY19 funds in
the amount of $549,614 for Community Development Housing Activities and $350,000 for Community
Development Public Facilities. This request is to bring the remaining funds forward that were approved during



FY19 and remained unspent at the end of the fiscal year. 

Community Development Home Fund 266 

7) Home Administration and Home Housing Activity - Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-
appropriate FY19 funds in the amount of $52,884 for Home Administration and $569,610 for Home
Housing Activity 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-appropriate FY19 funds in
the amount of $52,884 for Community Development Home Administration and $569,610 for Community
Development Housing Activity. This request is to bring the remaining funds forward that were approved during
FY19. 

Community Development Home Fund 267 

8) Support Housing Program Grants - Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-appropriate
FY19 funds in the amount of $24,552 for Support Housing Program Grants 

The Board is requested to approve Budget Ordinance Amendment B200536 to re-appropriate FY19 funds in
the amount of $24,552 for Community Development Support Housing Program Grants. This request is to
bring the remaining funds forward that were approved during FY19. 

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Approve Budget Ordinance Amendments



CLERK TO THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: KELLIE BEAM, DEPUTY CLERK TO THE BOARD

DATE: 10/30/2019

SUBJECT: SENIOR CITIZENS ADVISORY COMMISSION (1 VACANCY)

BACKGROUND

The Senior Citizens Advisory Commission has the following one (1) vacancy:
 
Patricia Fairley – completed second term.  Not eligible for reappointment. 
The Senior Citizens Advisory Commission recommends Tracy Honeycutt. 
(See attached). 
 
 
 
I have attached the current membership list and applicant list for this committee.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Nominate individual to fill the one (1) vacancy above.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
Senior Citizens Advisory Commission Nomination Backup Informatoin Backup Material













CLERK TO THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS AGENDA OF NOVEMBER 4, 2019

TO: BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

FROM: CANDICE H. WHITE

DATE: 11/4/2019

SUBJECT: CUMBERLAND COUNTY JUVENILE CRIME PREVENTION COUNCIL (2
VACANCIES)

BACKGROUND

At their October 21, 2019 regular meeting, the Board of Commissioners nominated the following individuals to
fill two (2) vacancies on the Cumberland County Juvenile Crime Prevention Council.
 
NOMINEE(S):
Person Under Age 18
Trenton Hightower
 
At-Large Representative
Terrasine Gardner
 
The JCPC membership roster is attached.

RECOMMENDATION / PROPOSED ACTION

Make appointments to the JCPC to fill the two (2) vacancies above.

ATTACHMENTS:
Description Type
JCPC Membership Roster Backup Material
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